
Subject: Titan's maps vs ACK's maps (split off)
Posted by Crimson on Mon, 16 Feb 2004 21:27:45 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

AlkalineCrimson 
Why? He earned the right to do those maps. Not that I fear not being able to include those maps...

Ya cause he can't make anything good himself, all the maps that are any good were made for him
and he adds trees and bushes some gay neon effects.... Every map he made on his own entirely
is SHIT, always will be shit, always has been shit. You play shit? Play maps made by ack from
scrath the shittest maps for renegade. Don't give me that crap he has the right, he can't do shit on
his own, and you backing up his crap saying his maps are good when in fact they aren't even
really his , is a joke. You rules are truly fucked and you will do anything to support this physco so
you shouldn't hold any retaraded little competetion at all.

You can't read. You just can't, can you? I said that I don't fear him not being able to use those
maps. However, you don't care about that because you'd rather think that I am scared he would
lose if he couldn't host the salvaged Westwood maps.

Quote:All the renalert maps are retarded,  open spaces pieces of crap with gay bushes every
where. 1 map is the same damn thing as every other map.

Yep, that's why my RA server is full most of the time.

Quote:Renalert is also a fluke and will die in a week or so, if it were so popular why do you only
have 1 renalert server istead of 2 now?

A fluke? I assure you it's a real game. :rolleyes: I have 1 server because people weren't filling
both. They never really did. It's scary to join an empty game on a non-official map because you
don't know when anyone will join.

Quote:Blackcell's ctf is more popular than this pos and people don't have to download anything.

Wrong. This should read "Blackcell's ctf is more popular ... BECAUSE people don't have to
download anything." -- The majority of the community doesn't download maps. It's a rule, and it
sucks. I hope to fix that with RenGuard and make it easier for fans to get maps.

Quote:ANything he made on his own is exacly what titan said, 2 bases facing each other with
some random shit in the middle be it a bridge or a shit steam of water.

Opinions are like assholes. Everyone has one.

Quote:Too bad ack has no more ww maps to jack which is why he probably stoped making maps
for renegade because.

Interesting, considering he's released several maps after he finished the salvaged Westwood
maps.
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Quote:Regardless, this thread was intended for titan to tell people about his new map and ACK
has to bardge and start his stupid shit,

I agree the post went off-topic, but really if we hadn't had this discussion, the thread would be on
the 4th page by now, so at least Titan's map is getting more publicity.

Quote:God forbid if ACK posted a map release and Titan did the same thing, the thread would
have been locked after the first post, or Titan's post deleted.

No, that's not the case. You see, you haven't been here for long. Unlike most other forums, I very
rarely discourage the free flow of ideas. I censor nothing and allow just about any thread to stick
around, even if it's insulting me. But since you're a n00b here you wouldn't really know that. Just
count the locked topics on here. You won't find many. The only ones we ever really lock are spam
threads like the one where people were quoting each other over and over.

The bottom line is, you need to have proof for your statements. I am offering proof in the way of a
competition. You are spouting your opinions and disputing the results before its even begun,
which is what I know you will do afterwards as well.

Let me state this again, if I host this competition, it will not in any way detract from the current
n00bstories servers. I have sufficient bandwidth, CPU power, and RAM to host these servers
without affecting or taking down my current servers.

Now, here is what I will no longer tolerate. One more word like this and you're banned. NOT for
disagreeing with me, but for disrespecting me. I can handle someone disagreeing with me, but the
insults are not necessary or valuable to this conversation.

"truly fucked"
"retaraded"
"fag heads"
"the bastard"

As for anyone else who doesn't like the thread -- don't read it. Actually, I will split the thread and
move this discussion to the Hot Issues forum.
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