
Subject: Re: Marijuana
Posted by Dave Anderson on Sun, 14 Jan 2007 04:53:36 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

Crimson wrote on Sat, 13 January 2007 20:19The problem I see is the things that drug addicts do
in order to get the financial means to pay for their high. I have an uncle who was a drug addict
(he's dead now, thank goodness)... he was in and out of jail from early teens for breaking into
people's houses and stealing shit to sell. Having marijuana illegal at this point is a strong
deterrent, allowing everyone over 18 to use it would encourage more people to take up the habit.

Everyone I've ever seen on weed has been a lazy fuck who doesn't want to do anything. And then
there was this guy I used to know who got drunk and high on January 5, 2000 and shot a 40 year
old mother of two in the face with a pistol, killing her... and all she was doing was delivering him a
pizza.

I have a friend who smokes Marijuana all the  time.  He is one of the laziest people I know.  He
finally got a job, but only so he can pay for his Marijuana, and he wastes every single penny on
the stuff.  Such a waste.  He is a lazy ass as well.  He's very smart, as a matter of fact, he doesn't
do any of his school work, yet he can pass all his tests with C's or better, and mostly A's.  But
what is the point?  He doesn't do his work and fails out of school.  He wastes all his money on a
drug that does no good for him at all.  A pathetic waste.

Gbull wroteI'm against Cigarettes, Alcohol, and Drugs. You shouldn't need any of these things and
they are a detriment to society. Combine the three and you have the reason why most people die
rapped up into one explanation.

That is all.

Exactly.  You shouldn't have to do drugs to have fun.  If you have to do drugs to have fun, you
must be a boring person, get a life.  Aside from that, there is no real point in wasting money on
something that will only make you "feel good" for a small amount of time.  You could be using your
money for better things to better yourself in life instead of being that pathetic person who relies on
drugs to have fun, feel good, and pass time.
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