
Subject: CNC REBORN: Refinery
Posted by uUnNcClLeE on Fri, 13 May 2005 08:16:55 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

Ack.. i'm curious..  if you hate the mod so much....  Why do you spend time bashing it.. like. is it
even worth your time?  the more you bash. the more potential ideas you provide for others to
improve upon (dont' say it is impossible coz they lack talent... that is not a fact. that is more of a
subjective assumption...)

age of 21..  beautiful life. etc etc..  i suppose "civilized and well educated" you should also be.....   
again.... why waste time..?  if you believe they're retards.. then why do you keep on telling the
retards that they're retards when the retards are never gonna understand what you're trying to
say? u're like. trying to get blood out of a rock...?  does that make you any smarter then the
retards? (not against you...  just an example..)

dislike it..(for everyone involved in flaming)...?  sure.. comment on it..  and if the creator disagree
with the comment..  leave him alone and he'll eventually be doomed if your point of view is right... 

like. come on....  if all of you beleive that you guys are all educated and right about yourselves....  
then let's act up to that socail status..  and stop flaming each other as if "oh i have so much
reputation to ruin"..the more you flame.. the more you show that your ugly side of life..... 

it's pretty much like...dragging down your down intellegence  to match an idiot.. then use the
langauge of an idiot to fight with him.... wtf would you do that? when you could just aviod it and be
as intellegent as you could be..?

one is not so great when one needs to bash others to make others look bad.... if one is so great..
one doesn't need to do a thing at all... the fool will make a fool out of him/herself as time passes
by......

just in case, i'm not against anyone....  i just want ppl to figure out how wasteful of time it is to
flame for 3.5 pages out of a 4 page thread...

yes.. i could just ignore this thread and don't comment on this.. but i'm not here to argue with
anyone.... i just wanted to look at the refinery and give my comment.... but before i got my
chance.. i ended up seeing such.. pointless debate of something that is totally subjective... and
never ending....

so plz don't flame me for my post....  the refinery is good.. is bad.. how to improve.... such a simple
comment is nothing related to "creator not willing to lishen"... "reborn suxxxxx"...  "i have a
girlfirend"... "next to a beach".... or whatever you guys brought up... creator not willing to listhen.
then it is their problem..  you commented. then you did your job... no more aggression needed..
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